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Public notices
A public notice is information in-
forming citizens of government ac-
tivities that may affect the citizens’ 
everyday lives. Public notices have 
been printed in local newspapers, 
the trusted source for community 
information, for more than 200 
years.

North Dakota newspapers also post 
public notices that are printed in 
newspapers on www.ndpublicno-
tices.com at no additional charge to 
units of government. 

NOTICE TO CREDITORS,
(N.D.C.C. 30.1-19-01) Sargent County 
Probate No. 41-2025-PR-00016 For 
Mark Edward Quam in the DISTRICT 
COURT OF SARGENT COUNTY, 
STATE OF NORTH DAKOTA in the 
matter of the Estate of Mark Edward 
Quam, Deceased. NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS NOTICE IS HEREBY 
GIVEN that the undersigned has been 
appointed personal representative of 
the above estate. All pe‹rsons having 
claims against the deceased are 
required to present their claims within 
three months after the date of the first 
publication or mailing of this notice or 
the claim will be forever barred. Claims 
must either be presented to Michael 
Quam, Personal Representative of the 
Estate, or filed with Sargent County 
Court. Dated this 26th day of 
September, 2025.
Personal Representative: 
Michael Quam
Address: 3404 E Zimmerly, 
Wichita, KS 67218
Email: markquam.estate@gmail.com
First Publication on the 26th day of 
September, 2025.

Publish September 26, 
October 3&10, 2025

ORDINANCE NO. 2025-1
An Ordinance granting to the Otter 

Tail Power Company, a Minnesota 
Company, its successors and assigns, 
permission to erect, construct, install 
and maintain within the City of 
Rutland, an electric light and power 
system and transmission lines and to 
operate the same and to install 
conduits, poles, wires, pipes and other 
fixtures in, upon and under the streets, 
alleys, bridges, and public grounds of 
said City for the purpose of furnishing 
electric light, heat and power to said 
City and the inhabitants thereof.

BE IT ORDAINED, BY THE CITY 
COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF Rutland, 
North Dakota, Hereinafter called the 
"City":

SECTION I
There is hereby granted to Otter Tail 

Power Company, a Minnesota 
Company, its successors and assigns, 
hereinafter called the Grantee, for a 
period of twenty (20) years from and 
after the passage and approval of this 
Ordinance and during all of said time, 
subject to the conditions and 
requirements hereinafter set forth, 
permission to construct, install and 
maintain an electric light and power 
system and transmission lines and to 
operate and maintain the same within 
and through the City and to transmit 
electricity to and from other towns or 
cities for the purpose of light, power and 
heat and to erect, construct, install and 
maintain conduits, poles, wires, pipes 
and other necessary fixtures and 
attachments upon and under the 
streets, alleys, bridges and public 
grounds of said City for the purpose of 
furnishing and selling electricity for 
light, heat and power and such other 
purposes for which electricity may be 
used by the inhabitants of said City, 
said permission and franchise to become 
operative and continue under the 
conditions hereinafter set forth.

SECTION 2
Said Grantee shall use poles, wires, 

crossanns, equipment and devices to 
conform with the standards of 
construction adopted by the National 
Electrical Safety Code of the United 
States, Department of Commerce, and 
all apparatus connected therewith shall 
be located so as not to obstruct the 
avenues, streets, and alleys of said City 
or to endanger persons or property or to 
hinder or to obstruct the use of said 
avenues, streets, and alleys for public 
places by the inhabitants of said City, or 
public in.general, or to interfere with 
any street,-sidewalk, curb, gutter or 
park improvements that the City may 
deem proper to make along the Imes of 
said avenues, streets and public places.

SECTION 3
All conduits, poles, wires and pipes 

installed by virtue of this Ordinance 
shall be installed in such places and in 
such manner as not unnecessarily to 
encroach upon streets, alleys, bridges, 
or public grounds of said City, and so as 
not to unnecessarily obstruct the use 
thereof for the ordinary purpose of 
travel thereon, and the erection thereof 
shall be subject to the reasonable 
supervision and direction of the City 
Council of the said City. Whenever 
practicable, all poles shall be set in 
alleys, and poles now in position upon or 
along the streets, whenever practicable, 
shall be removed, and the locations of all 
of said poles shall be designated by the 
Mayor under the supervision of the City 
Council of the said City.

All poles where set in alleys shall be 
set at or near the boundary line thereof, 
and where set in streets shall be located 
at such distances, as shall be directed by 
the city, from the property line of the 
abutting owner, and shall be placed so 
as not to interfere with the construction 
of placing of any waterpipes, sewers, or 
drains or the flow of water therefrom 
which have been or may be placed by 
authority of said City. In the event that 
said Grantee shall make any 
unnecessary obstruction of said streets, 
alleys, public grounds or places not 
designated by the City Council, the City 
may cause the removal of such 
obstructions and charge and collect from 
such Grantee the actual cost of such 
removals.

SECTION 4
During the construction, 

maintenance or enlargement of any part 
of said electric light and power system, 
said Grantee shall not unnecessarily 
impede or block travel in said streets 
and highways in said city, and shall 
leave all streets, highways, alleys, 
sidewalks, curbs, lanes and public 
places and all grounds disturbed by said 
construction in good condition upon the 
completion of said work.

The City reserves the right for itself 
and its agents to make and adopt, and 
the rights and privileges hereby granted 
shall at all times be and remain subject 
to, such reasonable regulations of a 
police nature as it may deem necessary 
for the best interests of the City but the 
City will not by an such regulations or 
by acts of its own or agents do anything 
to prevent or interfere with the Grantee 
carrying on its business in accordance 
with the franchise hereby granted.

SECTION 5
Whenever the said Grantee in 

erecting, constructing and maintaining 
said lines or poles, shall take up any of 
the pavements, sidewalks crossings or 
curbs on any of the avenues, streets and 
alleys or public places in said City or 
shall make any excavations thereon; 
such excavations shall be refilled and 
the sidewalk, crossing or curb replaced 
under the direction of the said City and 
any excavation so made shall be 
properly lighted at night during the 
construction, and in case of the failure 
to do so on the part of the said Grantee, 
then the said City may do the same at 
the expense of said Grantee and said 
Grantee agrees to pay said City for the 
reasonable cost or value of said work. 
Said Grantee shall be liable for all loss 
or damage caused by the negligence of 
Grantee, which may result to persons or 
property within the said City, caused by 
it, or its agents, servants, or employees 
in erecting, operating and maintaining 
the said electric system within said 
City, and shall at all times save the City 
harmless from any and all damages to 
persons or property in erecting, 
operating or maintaining said electric 
system.

SECTION 6
There is granted to said Grantee, its 

successors and assigns, during the term 
hereof, permission and authority to trim 
all trees in alleys, streets and public 
grounds of said City so as to remove all 
parts of said trees interfering with the 
proper erection maintenance and 
operation of poles, cables, wires, masts 
or other fixtures, or appliances installed 
or to be installed pmsuant to authority 
hereby granted.

Said Grantee shall have full right 
and authority to assign any person, 
persons, firm or corporation all the 
rights that are given it by this 
Ordinance, provided that the assignee 
of such rights by accepting such 
assignment shall become subject to the 
terms and conditions of this Ordinance.

SECTION 7
The Grantee shall use due diligence 

and care in furnishing electric service as 
herein provided but shall not be liable 
for any loss or damage which may arise 
from failure of the service, either partial 
or total, but this shall not be construed 
to exempt said Grantee from liability for 
negligence.

SECTION 8
The rates to be charged by said 

Grantee in the said City shall be filed 
with the Public Service Commission of 
the State of North Dakota, and no 
increase or decrease in said rates shall 
be made except in accordance with the 
rules and regulations of the Public 
Service Commission.

SECTION 9
This contract shall be subject to any 

present or future laws of a regulatory 
nature enacted by the State of North 
Dakota, or an any amendment or 
addition to such laws and further shall 
be subject to the rules and regulations 
laid down by the Public Service 
Commission of the State of North 
Dakota.

SECTION 10
The City reserves the right during 

the term hereof to enact and assess a 
franchise fee such as it deems 
necessary, upon reasonable advance 
notice to Grantee of not less than sixty 
(60) days.

SECTION II
In the event the City should sell or 

transfer real property which is subject 
to Grantee's franchise and should it 
become necessary to remove conduits, 
poles, wires or pipes installed by virtue 
of this ordinance the removal shall be 
done at the expense of the Grantee upon 
the request of the City.

SECTION 12
This Ordinance shall take effect and 

be in full force from and after its 
passage and approval by the City 
Council. The said Grantee shall specify 
its acceptance of this franchise in 
writing, to be filed with the City Auditor 
and in no event shall this Ordinance be 
binding on said Grantee until the filing 
of such acceptance.

Approved this June 2nd, 2025.
/S/Michael Mahrer

Mayor, City of Rutland
Attest /s/ Deborah J. Banish
Title: City Auditor, City of Rutland

ACCEPTANCE
OTTER TAIL POWER COMPANY, a 

Minnesota corporation, acting through 
its proper officers thereunto duly 
authorized, does hereby accept 
Ordinance No. 2025-1 of the City of 
Rutland, North Dakota, being an 
Ordinance granting a franchise to Otter 
Tail Power Company, and being 
entitled:

"AN ORDINANCE GRANTING 
TO THE OTTER TAIL POWER 
COMPANY, A MINNESOTA 
CORPORATION, ITS 
SUCCESSORS AND ASSIGNS, 
PERMISSION TO ERECT, 
CONSTRUCT, INSTALL, AND 
MAINTAIN WITHIN THE CITY 
OF Rutland ,NORTH DAKOTA, 
AN ELECTRIC LIGHT AND 
POWER SYSTEM AND 
TRANSMISSION LINE, AND TO 
OPERATE THE SAME, AND TO 
INSTALL CONDUITS, POLES, 
WIRES, PIPES, AND OTHER 
FIXTURES IN, UPON AND 
UNDER THE STREETS 
ALLEYS, BRIDGES, AND 
PUBLIC GROUNDS OF SAID 
CITY FOR THE PURPOSE  OF  
FURNISHING ELECTRIC  
LIGHT,  HEAT,  AND POWER 
TO SAID CITY AND THE 
INHABITANTS THEREOF";

and all of the terms, conditions, 
requirements, and provisions of said 
Ordinance No. 2025-1

IN WITNESAWHEREOF, Otter Tail 
Power Company has caused this 
Acceptance to be duly executed this 15th 
day of September, 2025.

In Presence of:
/S/Barbara LaPlante
/S/Cynthia Geray
OTTER TAIL POWER COMPANY,
/S/Tim Rogelstad (President)
/S/Cary Stephenson (Legal Council)
STATE OF MINNESOTA)
                                         SS)
COUNTY OF OTTER TAIL)
On this 15, September 2025, before 

me, a Notary Public within and for said 
County, personally appeared Tim 
Rogelstad and Cary Stephenson to me 
personally known, who, being each by 
me duly sworn, did say that they are, 
respectively, the President, and 
Associate General Counsel of Otter Tail 
Power Company, the corporation named 
in the foregoing instrument, and that 
said instrument was signed in behalf of 
said corporation by authority of its 
Board of Directors, and said Tim 
Rogelstad and Cary Stephenson 
acknowledged said instrument to be the 
free act and deed of said corporation.

/S/ Margaret Therese Gettel
Notary Public

The foregoing Acceptance was duly 
filed in the office of the City Auditor of 
the City of Rutland, North Dakota, this  
22nd day of  September, 2025.

/S/ Deborah J. Banish
Publish October 3, 2025

ESTATE AUCTION 
Saturday Oct 11, 2025 ▪ 10:30 AM  

Location: 110 Maple Wood Drive Gwinner, ND 
Owner: George Bauer Estate 

This Sale Includes: Gas Pumps, Anvils, 
Collectible Items, Household, Pickup, 

Motorcycle, Moped, Trailer,  
Suburban, Garage Items, Snowblower, 

Tools, Lawnmowers, Guns, & More! 
Auctioneers note: George has passed 

away and his family has decided to hold 
an auction on his well-taken care of 

items.  There is a wide variety of high 
quality Items - Make plans to attend! If 

you have any questions, call Derek 
(auctioneer) at (605) 949-2170  

or Dan (family) at (701) 680-9949. 

www.midwestauctions.com/ostby 


